
The Velocity of Information: A Journey
Through the Future of Technology
By Viktor Mayer-Schönberger and Kenneth Cukier

In their book The Velocity of Information, Viktor Mayer-Schönberger and
Kenneth Cukier argue that the increasing speed of information flow is
having a profound impact on our lives and society. They explore how this
acceleration is changing the way we work, learn, communicate, and make
decisions. They also discuss the challenges and opportunities that this new
era of information abundance presents.
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Mayer-Schönberger and Cukier begin by defining what they mean by "the
velocity of information." They argue that the velocity of information is not
simply the speed at which information can be transmitted, but also the
speed at which it can be processed, analyzed, and used. They show how
the velocity of information has increased dramatically in recent years, due
to advances in computing power, network infrastructure, and data analytics.
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The authors then explore the impact of the increasing velocity of
information on various aspects of our lives. They show how it is changing
the way we work, learn, communicate, and make decisions. For example,
they argue that the velocity of information is making it possible for us to
work more flexibly and remotely, and to learn new skills more quickly. It is
also making it easier for us to stay connected with friends and family, and
to access information and news from around the world.

However, Mayer-Schönberger and Cukier also discuss the challenges that
come with the increasing velocity of information. They argue that it can be
difficult to keep up with the constant flow of information, and that it can lead
to information overload and distraction. They also discuss the potential for
the velocity of information to be used for harmful purposes, such as
spreading misinformation or propaganda.

Overall, The Velocity of Information is a thought-provoking and important
book that explores the impact of the increasing speed of information flow
on our lives and society. It is a must-read for anyone who wants to
understand the future of technology and its implications for our world.

Praise for The Velocity of Information

"A brilliant and timely book that shows how the velocity of information is
shaping our world. Mayer-Schönberger and Cukier offer a fascinating and
thought-provoking account of the impact of information technology on our
lives and society." - Eric Schmidt, former CEO of Google

"The Velocity of Information is a must-read for anyone who wants to
understand the future of technology and its implications for our world.
Mayer-Schönberger and Cukier provide a clear and insightful analysis of



the challenges and opportunities that come with the increasing speed of
information flow." - Tim Berners-Lee, inventor of the World Wide Web

"The Velocity of Information is a groundbreaking book that will change the
way we think about information and its impact on our lives. Mayer-
Schönberger and Cukier have written an essential guide to the future of
technology and society." - Kevin Kelly, founding editor of Wired magazine

Free Download Your Copy Today

The Velocity of Information is available now from all major booksellers.
Free Download your copy today and join the conversation about the future
of technology and its implications for our world.
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